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TO: Freestanding Mental Health Clinics and Hospital Outpatient Providers 

RE: CT BHP Extended Day Treatment (EDT) Reimbursement Rate Increase for HUSKY Members 

 
The purpose of this policy transmittal is to inform 
providers serving Connecticut Behavioral Health 
Partnership (CT BHP) members that the Extended Day 
Treatment (EDT) rate has changed for dates of service 
July 1, 2011 and forward.     
 
Extended Day Treatment 
Effective July 1, 2011 for HUSKY A, B, Charter Oak 
and DCF Limited Benefit Program clients and January 
1, 2012 for HUSKY C and D clients, EDT services will 
be reimbursed at the rate of $82.03 per day. Providers 
are only permitted to bill the appropriate EDT 
procedure code for services provided in the EDT 
program.  Hospital providers should use Revenue 
Center Code (RCC) 907 and freestanding mental health 
clinics should use procedure Code H2012 when billing 
for EDT.  No other codes are to be billed for EDT 
services.  Payment for EDT services is limited to sites 
licensed by the Department of Children and Families 
(DCF) to provide these services.  Please note that these 
services require registration or authorization from 
ValueOptions, the CT BHP Administrative Services 
Organization.   
 
Please note, HP will automatically identify all 
previously paid HUSKY A, HUSKY B, Charter Oak, 
and DCF Limited Benefit claims with dates of services 
on or after July 1, 2011 and all HUSKY C and HUSKY 
D claims with dates of service on or after January 1, 
2012 and reprocess them according to the new fee.  
 
Fee Schedules 
 
DSS fee schedules are now posted to the Web site in 
CSV (Comma Separated Values) format.  The fee 
schedules can be accessed and downloaded by going to 
the Connecticut Medical Assistance Web site: 
www.ctdssmap.com. From this Web page, go to 
“Provider”, then to “Provider Fee Schedule 

Download”, click on “I Accept” and then select “Clinic 
- Mental Health”.   
 
 
Billing Questions 

For billing questions, please contact the HP Provider 
Assistance Center, Monday through Friday from 8:00 
a.m. to 5:00 p.m. at 1-800-842-8440. 
 
Posting Instructions:  Policy Transmittals can be 
downloaded from the HP Web site at 
www.ctdssmap.com.    
 
Distribution:  This policy transmittal is being 
distributed to holders of the Connecticut Medical 
Assistance Program Provider Manual by HP. 
 
Responsible Unit: DSS, Division of Health Services, 
William Halsey, Director of Behavioral Health, (860) 
424-5077.  
 
Date Issued:  October 2012 
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